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?????

After our representative meets and greets you at the Cairo Airport, you will travel to Mars Alam. Our agent will be there to greet you when
you get to the airport. He will drive you to your lodging so you can unwind in a stylish vehicle. There's much to do after lunch, including
diving, snorkeling, surfing, and lounging on the beach. Savor the tranquility, beautiful weather, charming beach, and crystal-clear blue water.
In addition, you can purchase presents for your loved ones and take a guided tour of the city's streets with one of our agents. The following
day, our agent will transport you to the airport so you may catch a flight home after breakfast at your hotel.

 ????????

Our representative will be waiting for you at the airport on arrival and with you during the visits and departure.

Transfers during visits and excursions as scheduled by a private, air-conditioned coach

Accommodation for 3 nights in the 5-star hotel "Pickalbatros Oasis Port Ghalib" or Similar in Marsa Alam, including Soft All-inclusive

All taxes

 ?? ????????

Entry visa to Egypt.



All flights.

Beverages. 

Tipping.

Personal expenses.

Anything not mentioned under “included” 

????s: 4

Nights: 3

???????????: Marsa Alam

?????: Pickalbatros Oasis Port Ghalib

????: 317 USD



????????

???? 1: Arrival



After our representative meets and greets you at the Cairo Airport, you will travel to Mars Alam. Our agent will be there to greet you when
you get to the airport. He will drive you to your lodging so you can unwind in a stylish vehicle. There's much to do after lunch, including
diving, snorkeling, surfing, and lounging on the beach. Savor the tranquility, beautiful weather, charming beach, and crystal-clear blue water.



In addition, you can purchase presents for your loved ones and take a guided tour of the city's streets with one of our agents. The following
day, our agent will transport you to the airport so you may catch a flight home after breakfast at your hotel.



???? 2: Marsa Alam

After our representative meets and greets you at the Cairo Airport, you will travel to Mars Alam. Our agent will be there to greet you when
you get to the airport. He will drive you to your lodging so you can unwind in a stylish vehicle. There's much to do after lunch, including
diving, snorkeling, surfing, and lounging on the beach. Savor the tranquility, beautiful weather, charming beach, and crystal-clear blue water.
In addition, you can purchase presents for your loved ones and take a guided tour of the city's streets with one of our agents. The following
day, our agent will transport you to the airport so you may catch a flight home after breakfast at your hotel.



???? 3: Safari Tour

After our representative meets and greets you at the Cairo Airport, you will travel to Mars Alam. Our agent will be there to greet you when
you get to the airport. He will drive you to your lodging so you can unwind in a stylish vehicle. There's much to do after lunch, including
diving, snorkeling, surfing, and lounging on the beach. Savor the tranquility, beautiful weather, charming beach, and crystal-clear blue water.
In addition, you can purchase presents for your loved ones and take a guided tour of the city's streets with one of our agents. The following
day, our agent will transport you to the airport so you may catch a flight home after breakfast at your hotel.



???? 4: Departure



After our representative meets and greets you at the Cairo Airport, you will travel to Mars Alam. Our agent will be there to greet you when
you get to the airport. He will drive you to your lodging so you can unwind in a stylish vehicle. There's much to do after lunch, including
diving, snorkeling, surfing, and lounging on the beach. Savor the tranquility, beautiful weather, charming beach, and crystal-clear blue water.
In addition, you can purchase presents for your loved ones and take a guided tour of the city's streets with one of our agents. The following
day, our agent will transport you to the airport so you may catch a flight home after breakfast at your hotel.
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????? ??????????? ?????: bookings@tripianto.com
?????: Dyar Business Park, Unit 15, El Hadba El Wosta, El Abagaia - El Mokattam, Egypt
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